50

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

qr.#1.f.76(3N).— = TwET A1 uF 4T Fw7 AfAtHEE, 2017 (2017 FT 14) v 4T 8 F ITUT (1)
* Tgd Y& Thdl &1 TANT Fd gU g T3h1Y, 39 a1d § §q2 2id gU % UAT HIAT SHed | Aa9@F ¢,
TRue & FERel 7Y, TaEel 9Rd 3R, A @A (TeeE T i ategEer |, 12/2017- 59
T T (3X) oA 28 57, 2017, ™ ar.anF. 703 (1), f&Fiw 28 7, 2017 % qEq AT & oI,

FfgET

7% faeeft, 25 sadt, 2018
. 2/2018- €9 TSTEH FX (IX)

ST, % W 11 % @< 3 ITE< (i) § WHTra Foha I o, § Aemferted serred wdl §, T -
I ATELAAT |, AV H -

(%)

FH HEAT 3 F HHET FHIAH (3) A TATE |, T ATHT” A&l o TIAT AT FLAHET (b ezt

T s :FTraa T S, -
(@) FH HEAT 3 37 3Ey gataa wiEAtet % geurq Reatafa w0 e siw gfafs=n #iv sqertoa
STTUSTT, 72T~
(1) (2) 3) (4) (5)
“dg | AT | GIAYT F Ao 2437 F Sq9d AT 9=TEd w AT | T s

99

Tiaem % aoes 2439 F favd et ae A @
aiy o oY w1 & gatea et ST F areaw
T Feg ALHTL, 5T GLHTT T 99 15T &0 AT 0T
TTERT0T AT TLHTET TTTARTOT IT ATy (9T T &%
ST ATeAT AT e ATl f S i (ores 71 it
ST T AYG AT oA THT A F GeT | 25

sferd & sfer 7 37 |
()  FY GEAT 16 F A9, Fiey (3) Ft IR F, “UF a0 9rsat F T X T AW oreai wr TiaEdTod
ERIES LT
() FH HET 19 3T AT Hargq qateAt F we=rq Metertaa w6 g9 o7 gfatedi #1 siaentua
[ERUSILCIARE IR
(1) (2) (3) “4) (5)
“og | o AaTea | fuq et Feew g | zawtate # fAfga # oft
9965 QQHWT;‘;T%Wﬁw%ﬁFW T 30 R, 2018 %
T ATLATA & FT AT 1 Tiaga :
e A A A T T Er
199 | o aa # Rug et feewm w7 | swyRflE A AR w i
9965 TEI & AT & drge feord freft worme FTa 30 forawae, 2018 =+
T FAAN F GRT WA A GEaed T8 AT Al BT |
T o HILAH | & ST qTeAT 74T

[PART II—SEC. 3(i)]




[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 51

(¥) 9 H=AT 22 % 98, Fiad (3) fit gfAf2 #, w7 (@) F ge=rq, Aefotaa 7w v siqenfog G
STTUSTT, T: -
“(m) T TRt =teR iy fentea, srearaeRt siw seETREt % afvees F forw wqiew arga o & vw aefies
AT T =TT, AeaTaeht ST FHATAT 6 TET I HaT T&TF FLdT gl Sl 1o feramead q& =t forar
T AT TqC AT THher T it FAAT F ATEAT | G FAATT T&T FaT g 17

(F) FH FEAT 29 F FHE A IAH FATId TATE & qearq Meferied 7 §er 7 g fedi wr i@
ENECRERISILCIAREIHE

(1) (2) 3) (4) ®)

sogg | T g FLATL 6l AT ST ATSTATSN 6 FaiTd qeserd | T o=,
9971 9T | ® HHATILAT &l A9 TT TLATLH He & HILAH T &
ofres =T ST ATt AT T&F 60 ST o6 Fow Jgata &f 15
9991 Strae | F9T |

() FH GEAT 36 F AU, FHiAH (3) T TATS &, 7 (1) § “TATH AT 9Tal F £ATT UL “GT AT eTeal T

EIRERNECRERIIS ILSIF
() FH "eAT 36 T IHH HaTeq WATSAT F qearq At w7 H§edr T Tarsdi # s e
o ST, e -
(1) 2) 3) (4) ()

wagx | ofid FH |ear 35 A1 36 # fafAfde AT Frsmarsh F O 9T o7,
9971 7 | STHT F HIEAR F & W ATAT FATT |

ofir
9991

(7)) FH "EAT 39 Y a9 Hated vttt & geunq, Mwtetea w0 e siv gttt v sfaenfa
[ERISIUIADEIHS

(1) (2) (3) (4) ()

wags | offT Tl g Far ar Few s e § R e | = o=
9971 qarar % ATered At ferae wEAafdEe qiEas
He (AETHUTHT) T2d gl, F g 7 & aTg? foord
Frft wmeg #r stavrsdr e Jarett F forg T
&0 & Fore et o qar § & 1€ fe=rd

TICEHTOT o~ T TAT® F 3297 & forw, smsuwuadt §
e Traei F Areey ¥ sfv TR stE A, AT
(i) For& s gwe 7 =8 Afeed srafa ar wegar &
& a1 et Rt g & =v e saafa <
g AT S sEuwuEHT & At F o P # i




52 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

EIREIGEAE R R R e

(ii) Forar sl o werem (st At @4 F )
=T, 2015 F aq 9T F FET # A
et ==t~ w7 =T B, Ar

D EIRER SR I IREICRI e R e A BET|
(Frarsi o @& %) & feem-fager, 2015 &
ST ATSURTHHT AAT STfeeRTy % ®7 H usfha &,
qr

(iv) FE s wiosgfa va fBffm 9, @& ) F
A wfayfa va e 9 (s, BT
a7 wex) frem-fAder, 2015 & v z@ FAfea
AAATT T &l 2 |

(1) FF TEAT 45 % TR, Fwaw (3) f wfafe d -

i. 7 (F), ST 9% (i) F Te=ATq, Fetorfaa 3o 7w v siaearfua G s, Tom-

“(iii) g AT, T ALHTL, T ST &0, TITAT TTTERT0T, LRI TTTERT0r A7 HEahT e,
i % (@), 3T 9T (jii) F T9ATq, MeATIEd 3T 7 & ST A9 HAT SITUIAT, T4T:-

“(iv) 7 TLRTL, ST TLRTE, T TS &, TATHIT TTIHLT, TCHRTL TTIRHLT AT G A
iii. 7% (), 3T A (i) F we=Tq, Refefa 3o v #ir saentia G s, aum-

“(iii) v TLRTE, TTST TLHRTL, TH ToT &, TATA T TTTERT0T, FEhTr TTTEERr AT FLhT HarT 17;

(2) %" " 53 ¥ 399 Hetaa yiafsat % gearq Ao ww d@emr s sttt v siaenfia
[ERISIUIADEIH

(1) (2) 3) @ |

sgag | o FIU IeATET F FATETSHT H gHT F WAW A & T AT | LT | g
9985 | AT

(3) FH HEAT 54 % qHe, wiaw (3) Fit wRAE F w7 (@), F wearq Ffafea ww @ daentia G
STTUSTT, 72T~

“(T) FS IATET F AATTIHT | AT & ATLAH F < ST ATeAt Hary, |”

(3) FH HEAT 60 F qFe, FHiw (3) i FfAfS & ersx “Faxer w=rrerg,” v At T Sromm, zem:

(8) #H HEAT 65 Y ITY Hateq iateal % earq Mefaied #7 gear i yEarsat & et
[ERIEILUIADEIHE



[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 53

(1) (2) 3) (4) (5)
“65% | o =T w1 ATAFTT srfarfaas, 2005 (2005 #7 22) & siata | LT | g7,
9991 ST T&T O % HTEqH | &1 ST aret aamy
(1) FY EEAT 66 F e, Fiaq (3) F wRATTH -

i, W= (F) % gearq, Metatad 7= v stoenfa G s, gom-

“(Fe) Toreft Srerfores |eerTe 3T 9T 6% & &9 H WAwa & Uas # Ta9r TEaT Fl Ao w1
& ST ATt '

i. 9% (@) .-

(F) IT-TE (iv) §, “ reaiis Fa< qaF” oreal & Aefea Brar s,

@) 3T (iv), F Te=rq, et 3o as v saentia G s, -
“(v) TSR SR AT fRTfeswe & o darse i

(1) UTeqF H, TR, FSF ST qeAT “qiATY (@) F T U oqe%, FTSH AT AT W (W) F 3T
Tz (i), (ii) 3 (i) 7 v gieeariog BT s,

() T o TeAT HEATIrgd Toeqah &0 S eqTad Rt STTuaT, TT:-
“Ferd ofie Y B 77 (@) F 37 \w (v) # [Afgg #rg off s7a UF Seamel o7 96 A8t gnft o i, -
(i) e q& foreT s S==ae Areata Tq¥ aF AT AHFET T % (08T F qreqq q; AT

(iy T sreeT sameattas forar gt % U fRe % w9 § forem % Aveaw & syt
EEL R
(q) FF GEAT 77 F 99, Fiew (3) 7 af=32 &, wg (1) F 97 gAC 9r5al k| T G g "
Y oreal 1 TiaeaTioa fhar Srosm, T9m:-

() %W HEAT 81 % wHer, FHiww (3) N AT F v ww fMwferfea afafe v sfaeerntaa B srom,
7T

“TAeATeTad | TaeT ST % =T H &f ST are(t 94T, -
(F) T, T AT Frue-v=- e qres a1 oo ff e g;

(@) TERTT THIIE, ST q9Trg &Y gfrre gfaetar, |@fa seef= ar w1 der s & qrerar
TS ISt THTE & f9e 2

(3T) |TeET IToT ST TH1UE;

() qTETHE;

STET ST "R (F), (@), (1) AT (F) | TAT F(9Gq AL AT TITHT | T4 F SATTHIL FHT TTdHA
500 9T fq =4t & AfaF T80 17 |

[®T. 5. 354/13/2018 -a°r3m‘{]
= fase, s af=e



54 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

Ae: T ATSHEAT F SATAEEAT Ho 12/2017- H [T &7 F (IX), faA1% 28 94, 2017,
ATo Fo o 703 (31), &A= 28 I, 2017 F Tgq LT % TSI, AATLTI, H THITAT
TR I o e =ad sifow a1 sfaR=mT Ho 47/2017- 59 57 &7 #:7(3X), faAiw 14
TqaeT, 2017, |To FTo o 1410 (31) 14 Faa¥, 2017 F T Ferre= BT =m

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th January, 2018
No. 2/2018- Union Territory Tax (Rate)

G.S.R.76(E).— In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 8 of the Union Territory Goods
and Services Tax Act, 2017 (14 of 2017), the Central Government, on being satisfied that it is necessary in the public
interest so to do, on the recommendations of the Council, hereby makes the following further amendments in the
notification of the Government of India, in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue), No.12/2017- Union
Territory Tax (Rate), dated the 28th June, 2017, published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-
section (i), vide number G.S.R. 703(E), dated the 28th June, 2017, namely:-

In the said notification, in the Table, -

(a) against serial number 3, in the entry in column (3), after the words “a Governmental Authority” the
words ““ or a Government Entity” shall be inserted;

(b) after serial number 3 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be
inserted, namely: -

@ (@) 3 “ )
“3A Chapter Composite supply of goods and services in which the value Nil Nil”;
99 of supply of goods constitutes not more than 25 per cent. of

the value of the said composite supply provided to the
Central Government, State Government or Union territory or
local authority or a Governmental authority or a Government
Entity by way of any activity in relation to any function
entrusted to a Panchayat under article 243G of the
Constitution or in relation to any function entrusted to a
Municipality under article 243W of the Constitution.

(c) against serial number 16, in the entry in column (3), for the words “one year”, the words “three
years” shall be substituted;

(d) after serial number 19 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -

€)) (©) 3 “) (&)
“19A | Heading Services by way of transportation of | Nil Nothing contained in this serial
9965 goods by an aircraft from customs station number shall apply after the
of clearance in India to a place outside 30" day of September, 2018.
India.
19B Heading Services by way of transportation of | Nil Nothing contained in this serial
9965 goods by a vessel from customs station of number shall apply after the

30" day of September, 2018.”;

clearance in India to a place outside India.

(e) against serial number 22, in the entry in column (3), after item (b), the following item shall be
inserted, namely: -



[ 9T [I-8vE 3(i)] YR T TSI : STHTHROT 55

“(0)

motor vehicle for transport of students, faculty and staff, to a person providing services of transportation of

students, faculty and staff to an educational institution providing services by way of pre-school education and

education upto higher secondary school or equivalent.”;

(f) after serial number 29 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -

)] (©)) 3 ) 5)
“29A | Heading Services of life insurance provided or agreed to be provided | Nil Nil”;
9971  or | by the Naval Group Insurance Fund to the personnel of
Heading | Ccoast Guard under the Group Insurance Schemes of the
9991 Central Government.
(g) against serial number 36, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “fifty thousand”, the
words “two lakhs” shall be substituted;
(h) after serial number 36 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -
)] (©)) 3 e 5)
“36A | Heading Services by way of reinsurance of the insurance schemes | Nil Nil”;
9971  or | gpecified in serial number 35 or 36.
Heading
9991
(i) after serial number 39 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -
0 @ 3) @ 5)
“39A | Heading Services by an intermediary of financial services located in a | Nil Nil”;
9971 multi services SEZ with International Financial Services

Centre (IFSC) status to a customer located outside India for
international financial services in currencies other than
Indian rupees (INR).

Explanation.- For the purposes of this entry, the intermediary
of financial services in IFSC is a person,-

(i) who is permitted or recognised as such by the
Government of India or any Regulator appointed for
regulation of IFSC; or

(ii) who is treated as a person resident outside India under
the Foreign Exchange Management (International Financial
Services Centre) Regulations, 2015; or

(iii) who is registered under the Insurance Regulatory and
Development Authority of India (International Financial
Service Centre) Guidelines, 2015 as IFSC Insurance Office;
or

(iv) who is permitted as such by Securities and Exchange
Board of India (SEBI) under the Securities and Exchange
Board of India (International Financial Services Centres)
Guidelines, 2015.

@

against serial number 45, in the entry in column (3),-

i. in item (a), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity;”;



56 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

ii. in item (b), after sub-item (iii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(@v) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity;”;

iii. in item (c), after sub-item (ii), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(iii) the Central Government, State Government, Union territory, local authority, Governmental Authority or
Government Entity.”;

(k) after serial number 53, and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -

@) (@) 3) “) &)
“53A | Heading Services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural | Nil Nil”;
9985 produce.

(1) against serial number 54, in the entry in column (3), after item (g), the following item shall be
inserted, namely:-
“(h) services by way of fumigation in a warehouse of agricultural produce.”;

(m) against serial number 60, in the entry in column (3), the words “the Ministry of External Affairs,”
shall be omitted;

(n) after serial number 65 and the entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall
be inserted, namely: -

@) (@) 3) “) &)
“65A | Heading Services by way of providing information under the Right to | Nil Nil”;
9991 Information Act, 2005 (22 of 2005).

(o) against serial number 66, in the entry in column (3),-
i. after item (a), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(aa) by an educational institution by way of conduct of entrance examination against consideration in the
form of entrance fee.”

ii. in item (b),-
(A) in sub-item (iv), the words “upto higher secondary” shall be omitted;
(B) after sub-item (iv), the following sub-item shall be inserted, namely:-
“(v) supply of online educational journals or periodicals:”;

(C) in the proviso, for the word, brackets and letter “entry (b)”, the words, brackets and letter “sub-items
(1), (i1) and (iii) of item (b)” shall be substituted;

(D) after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided further that nothing contained in sub-item (v) of item (b) shall apply to an institution providing
services by way of,-

(i) pre-school education and education up to higher secondary school or equivalent; or
(i) education as a part of an approved vocational education course.”;

(p) against serial number 77, in the entry in column (3), in item (c), for the words “five thousand”, the
words “seven thousand five hundred” shall be substituted;



[9mT I-'vs 3(i)] RA hT SIS : STHIYRO 57

Note :

(q) against serial number 81, for the entry in column (3), the following entry shall be substituted namely:

“Services by way of right to admission to-
(a) circus, dance, or theatrical performance including drama or ballet;

(b) award function, concert, pageant, musical performance or any sporting event other than a recognised
sporting event;

(c) recognised sporting event;
(d) planetarium,

where the consideration for right to admission to the events or places as referred to in items (a), (b), (c) or (d)
above is not more than Rs 500 per person.”.

[F. No.354/13/2018 -TRU]
RUCHI BISHT, Under Secy.

The principal notification was published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide notification No. 12/2017 -
Union Territory Tax (Rate), dated the 28thJune, 2017, vide number G.S.R. 703 (E), dated the 28t June, 2017
and was last amended by notification No0.47/2017 - Union Territory Tax (Rate), dated the 14" November, 2017
vide number G.S.R. 1410(E), dated the 140 November, 2017.

i
75 faeett, 25 s9asT, 2018

&A1 3/2018- €Y TSTAT T (N)

ALFLRA. 77(.).— T9 5T 7T U qarR afafam, 2017 (2017 F7 14) F =T 7 FF 3741 (3) F I=8d
Sa oTfRRal FT TAN Fd Xy AT, giug & AeErfent ¥ sram uw, naggn, awna avar, Ow geaers (e
faram) & srfag=ET 90 13/2017- €9 Ts7eT #¥ (39), fadi® 28 57, 2017, & av0F10f70 704 (%), fa=i, 28 57,
2017 % Tgd WA & TSI, AT, F 90 ||, gve 3, 37-gve (i) § yariera &rar wam or, o Awfafea siv smr of
YA FAT g, TAqT -

IFq Afer=T H, -

()

el #, w9 TEAT 5 $Y 39q "qataa wfafat & gemq, Metafa w0 d@er siw sug gatea gttt i

s e T STTosm, e

(1) 2 (3) (4)
“5% | ¥ W v Far w7 afyfem, 2017 (2017 # | ¥ex weATE, Tew | FAd WE U fET FY
12) 3 st i Beft =7R% Fr o= wfY Y | WA, w9 awer | FA0TAH, 2017 F A afsd we
FBRTT TT 3T Feg WA, 5T O, 99 e | O AT EEE TSTAT A UH HAT AW
S0 AT ETRT ST 3 T A S AR et | | A afefm, 2017 f amr 21 %
T (vi), ¥ ST oo wrS o
=T=F |
(i)  TIEEI H, IT AT (2.) F LA AT STATET HI Fq AT AT ST, T2T-

‘(=) Tt T srfderat” w1 afem 3@ g S e forw & srfarfRe, 1938 (1938 w1 4) # aRT 2 %
ITETHT (10) ® far mar g
[FT. . 354/13/2018- 'fml'{‘{[]

=t e, s afea



